
Divine Delights 
And I will delight myself in thy commandments, 

which I have loved. (Psalms 119:47) 

It is so amazing that God’s Word which was written so long ago 
is so relevant and necessary for today.  This is because the au-
thor is our all knowing God and His Word is living and power-
ful.  What a blessing that we have His Word readily available to 
us!  Since this book is the best book to read, we should have no 
reason to neglect it.  
 
Through the last few months, I have had a couple of potentially 
life threatening experiences.  Last December, a 3cm lump was 
found in my breast (it is still there).  In January, an ultrasound 
showed that Ruthanna was not growing well (a later ultrasound 
showed this to be incorrect).  In February, I gave birth to our 
beautiful baby girl.  For the next month, I had many blood clots 
appearing in my legs.  These experiences are nothing compared 
to what many people go through, but they can still be unsettling 
if I choose to worry about them.   
 
There is always something in God’s Word for every situation 
that we find ourselves in.  The Lord brought to my mind a verse 
that kept coming back to me whenever I would dwell on my cir-
cumstances.  Thou wilt keep him in perfect peace, whose mind 
is stayed on thee: because he trusteth in thee. (Isaiah 26:3)  I 
was reminded again and again to keep my mind on the Lord 
and trust Him for He knows what is best.  I particularly remem-
ber going over and over this verse during labour.  It is true that 
when I keep my trust in the Lord, I do have perfect peace.  The 
unknown is not scary when I remember that the Lord knows 
and has a plan that works out for good. 
 

Jesus, Jesus, how I trust Him! 
How I’ve proved Him o’er and o’er! 

Jesus, Jesus, precious Jesus! 
O for grace to trust Him more! 

Dear Ladies, 
 May you be encouraged and delight in the Lord also. 

Love Heather. 


